
EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

The forum Invest in Paraguay, hosted by the 
Ministry of Industry and Commerce of Para-
guay, the Investments and Exports Network 
(REDIEX) and the Inter-American Develop-
ment Bank (IDB) is the most important 
investment event ever held in the country. It 
will be an in-person event with live streaming 
and will take place on September 8th and 
9th, 2022 at the CONMEBOL Convention 
Center in Asuncion, Paraguay.

This event will highlight the exceptional con-
ditions that Paraguay offers to FDI. It will 
bring together international investors with 

businesspersons located in Paraguay, and 
with government authorities in charge of 
investment attraction and business promo-
tion policies.

During the forum, several presentations will 
showcase the most relevant trends and sec-
tors currently existent with regard to return 
on investment. The event will connect as well 
foreign investors with businesspersons and 
high authorities of Paraguay, through deba-
tes, one-on-one meetings, and networking 
events.
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